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Key Digital University Boasts AVIXA and CEDIA Accredited 
Curriculum 

Key Digital’s online training courses a go-to resource for continuing education renewal units 

MOUNT VERNON, NY – January 26, 2021 – Key Digital, the leaders in digital video and control systems, 
announces exciting new updates to its online curriculum available within the highly-educational and 
accredited Key Digital University.  

Dedicated to elevating dealers’ ability to design, build, and install high-end commercial and residential 
applications with ease, Key Digital University (KDU) offers certification courses and webinars with a 
sweeping scope covering Key Digital’s hardware and software ecosystem plus studies focused on general 
AV fundamentals.  

All six current courses are AVIXA CTS, AVIXA CTS-D, and CEDIA certified with all passing participants 
receiving AVIXA CTS and CTS-D RU credits and CEDIA Certification upon completion of a course. Best of 
all, Key Digital University is FREE for all registered dealers. Dealers can presently earn up to 20 AVIXA 
RUs and 7.5 CEDIA CEUs with the content available on KDU. 

AVIXA certification is recognized for its credibility and integrity. In pro AV, the Certified Technology 
Specialist™ (CTS) program is the leading professional credential with ANSI-accredited to the ISO 17024 
standard to meet the highest standards. 

CEDIA Certification is a set of credentials that reflect defined areas of knowledge in the home technology 
industry. By earning and retaining certification, dealers demonstrate that they have completed the required 
study and possess the field experience to master a particular skillset and body of knowledge. 

KDU is currently comprised of three main categories. Firstly, Digital Video Fundamentals gives a thorough 
base understanding on exactly how the technologies HDMI and HDBaseT work, and also delves into 
system design and AV over IP preparation. The iAVC1 course covers Key Digital products and the benefits 
of the company’s many built-in integration and troubleshooting tools. The third course offered is on Key 
Digital’s control software, Compass Control Pro, and it has something for everyone starting with basic 
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module programming and progressing to full custom programming to provide expertise on this cost-
effective and flexible control software.  

About Key Digital® 

Led by the “Father of DVD”, Mike Tsinberg, Key Digital® is an InfoComm, CEDIA, CES, and NAHB award 
winning manufacturer of professional distributed video and control system equipment.    

Since 1999, Key Digital has led the constantly evolving AV industry by designing products that deliver 
industry leading quality, performance, and reliability to corporate, bar & restaurant, digital signage, 
education, government, and house of worship applications.   

Key Digital products are designed and engineered in-house in Mount Vernon, NY. Superior quality, ease-
of-installation, and versatility are the result of strenuous research, development, and testing. Expertise and 
unparalleled knowledge have created a unique hardware-software suite solution ideal for the consultants, 
designers, and installation firms of the AV industry. Key Digital® is known to deliver best-in-class products 
based on quality, performance, and reliability.  

For more information, visit our webpage at http://www.keydigital.com. 

 


